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John Price is a forty-something resident of the forgotten far northeast 
Bethlehem. He is a computer nerd by day and political wonk and local 
government follower in the shadows of the night. A socially liberal, 
fiscal conservative in a world gone mad, he wonders if he is in danger 
of extinction. 

Gadfly, 

I disagree with your assessment of the Reynolds mailer. In the world of 
balls and strikes, it was a strike. 

Grubb has made his experience as a city administrator a centerpiece of 
his campaign.  That experience includes the behavior he exhibited while 
being in that position, including being forced to retire for getting into a 
fight. 

Recently, Grubb offered an explanation for the fight that contradicts the 
reporting done by 4 Morning Call journalists in three separate news 
articles on the incident that are available online.  Grubb even went as far 
as to say one of the journalists had it out for him due to complaints he 
made against him.  That journalist is now deceased and not here to 
defend himself from the slanderous allegation.   And while he did not call 
the stories “fake news” per se, it was his way of saying the news articles 
were not true.   Sounds familiar to a former president. 

The account in the below article is one that I have not seen posted, but I 
think proves Grubb’s version of the events in his recent explanation is 
malarkey, and includes the testimony of 2 employees that insinuates 
Grubb was the aggressor.  https://www.mcall.com/news/mc-xpm-2005-
02-03-3591164-story.html 

Grubb compounded the fighting incident into years of bashing the city’s 
mayors, councils and personnel.  The incident has defined Grubb for the 
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last 17 years and is entirely relevant to his temperament to be 
mayor.   The incident also sheds light on to his temperament and 
behavior prior to the fight.   As set forth from the hearing testimony, he 
“barked” at an employee, and had heated discussions with a bureau 
chief, he later tried to confront. 

He has on at least one occasion compared the Donchez administration to 
that of Nazi Germany.   I understand he became a “gadfly” and critic, but 
even critics should be held accountable for outlandish statements. 

He even attended health board meetings after his termination and was 
accused of intimidation of the Health Bureau Director at the time.  It got 
to the level where police had to be present at the meetings. 

He has also claimed to be an informant for the FBI.  I find this claims to 
be outlandish.  First, I am not sure why it is relevant to his explain his 
behavior.  Second, no one from Bethlehem was indicted on Federal 
charges.  So either he had nothing to offer, the FBI found his information 
to be unfounded, or he is lying. 

The Reynolds mailer was a fair mailer that cited facts.  The comparison 
to Trump is apt, as Grubb has acted in a Trumpian manner several times 
over the years.   Grubb simply lacks the temperament to be Mayor. 

(Also, I am a real person, who commented on this blog long before this 
race, as you know). 

John 

 


