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Lieut. Col. Edmond J. Buckley 
Back From Pacific War Fro I 

Lieut. Colonel Edmund J. Buck-
ley, U.' S. Marine Corps, in private 
life executive vice-president of the 
Union Bank and Trust Company, 
arrived home on leave from strenu-
ous campaigns in ,the Pacific 
theatre of war. Colonel Buckley 
arrived in the East yesterday and 

' is now at his home with his family 
near Center Valley. 

• In the Marine Reserve at the 
outbreak of the war, it was but na-
tural that the local banker should 
be called into service. Up to press 
time this afternoon Col. Buckley 

i had not called on his business asso-
: ciates, who are happy over his safe 
j arrival in his home community. 

In addition to his rapid promo-
tions, Col. Buckley has been cited 
on a number of occasions, the last 
coming on January 23 for outstand-

I ing performance of his duties in 
the Borgen Bay area, New Britain, 
a day after Christmas. 

Mrs. Buckley is the former Miss 
Edna Caroline French of Llanerch. 
They have three children, Edmond' 
•J. Jr., Catherine and Robin David. 

LX. COL. E. J. BUCKLEY 
• • . back from battle 


